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Reva Young

From: Michael Etzkorn <metzkorn@gracehill.coms
Sent: Monday, January 23, 2023 4:48 PM

To: Reva Young

Subject: Re: 2023 NCP certification renewal
HiReva,

Thank you for reaching back out and | sincerely apologize for not following up after returning from my trip.
At the moment, we are in the process of revamping the NCP designation that was offered by Elizabeth
Mooreland and are not renewing the NCP at this time. However, the good news is the designation is still

Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns. Also, I've added you to our emailing list for tax
credit related information so that you don't miss any updates coming out over the next few months.

Best regards,

Michael Etzkorn
Account Manager

(864) 641-4603
metzkormn®gracehill.com

Grace Hill®

Policies » Training + Assessment

1-866-GRACEHILL

www.GraceHill.com

This email may contain confidential or proprietary materials for the sole use of the intended recipient. Any review, use, distribution, or
disclosure by others is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and delete alf
copies. We are committed to protecting personal data and adhering to the principles outlined in the EU-US Privacy Shield and the
General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR). Please review our privacy policy for more details.

-On Mon, Jan 23, 2023 at 3:50 PM Reva Young <ryoung@intermarkmgt.com> wrote:
- Good afternoon Michael -

i I'm justfollowing up on how to renew my certification.
Thanks for your help with this!

' Reva Young, Director of Compliance, NCP, CPO, AHM

1



- 808-B Lady Street

" Columbia, SC 29201

. 803-744-9229 phone

© 808-790-2020 fax

- www.intermarkmgt.com

— Original Message-----

" From: Michael Etzkorn <metzkorn@gracehill.com>

. Sent: Friday, December 30, 2022 9:09 AM
i To:Reva Young <ryoung®@intermarkmgt.com>
. Subject: RE: 2023 NCP certification renewal

Thank you for your email. | am out of the office December 29th - January 3rd, 2023. | will respond as
. soon as possible.

If you need technical support, please contact our Support Team at 866.GRACEHILL. If you have an
~ accounting question, please contact our Accounting Team at accounting@gracehill.com.

If this is an urgent matter, please email Megan Russell at mrussell@gracehill.com.

~ Best regards,

Michael Etzkorn
¢ Account Manager

' (864) 641-4603
metzkorn@gracehill.com

' Bestregards,

' *Michael Etzkorn*
. Account Manager

| (864) 641-4603

- metzkorn@gracehill.com

<https://gracehill.com/>

. <https://www.facebook.com/GraceHillTraining/>

¢ <https://www Ainkedin.com/company/grace-hill/>

g <MIm1ww_an§tagram.cgm/wea[egracgh_ itl/?hl=en>

' 1-866-GRACEHILL



www.GraceHill.com <http://www.gracehill.com>

 This email may contain confidential or proprietary materials for the sole use of the intended recipient.
: Any review, use, distribution, or disclosure by others is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended

' recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and delete all copies. We are committed to

- protecting personal data and adhering to the principles outlined in the EU-US Privacy Shield and the

- General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR). Please review our privacy policy
<mgﬂ[mg§@&§omwwebsitg-pcivagyiQILQyp for more details.
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Username Password

NAHMA -

The National Affordable Housing 400 N. Columbus St. Suite

Management Association A i VA 22314 (703) 683-8630 Online store

AboutUs  Membership  Affordable 100 Agencies Advocacy  Mestings  Educailon Awards & Qontests  Mambers Ouly

Home / Store / Checkout | Site Search

%

Order received

Thank you. Your order has been received.

ORDER NUMBER: DATE: : TOTAL: : PAYMENT METHOD:
21604 . August 21, 2023 $180.00 - Credit Card
Order details

¢ PRODUCT TOTAL

2023 SHCM® Certification Renewal x 1

Customer Contact ID: 66228 §180.00
Name on the Invoice: Deborah Taggart

SUBTOTAL: $180.00
PAYMENT METHOD: Credit Card
- TOTAL: $180.00

Upload Documents
(Optional)

Please upload your continuing credit
documents to your certification renewal
order

1. 13844_SHCM_Continuing_Educatic

Delete file(s) Download / View

file(s)
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——
NAHB.

National Association of Home Builders
1201 15th Street NW, Washington DC 20005

Phone: (202) 266-8117, 1-800-368-5242 Receipt
Fax: (202)266-8695
Invoice #: 6508434
Date: 09/26/2024
Customer ID #: 2020074
Page: 1
Bill To: Ship To:
KIZZIE SMALLS KIZZ1E SMALLS
Compliance Monitoring Officer Compliance Monitoring Officer
SC HOUSING SC HOUSING
BLYTHEWOOD, SC 29016 BLYTHEWOOD, SC 29016
Quantity Item Description Unit Price Discount Extended
1.00 | NAHB HCCP Professional Designation Renewal Fee $235.00 $0.00 $235.00
Subtotal: $235.00
Sales Tax: $0.00
Shipping/Handling: $0.00
Grand Total: $235.00
Payment Type: Credit Card Reference Transacti Payment Total: $235.00

Account #:  4XXXXXXXXXxX4201

Amount Due:

$0.00




